


And so, dear brothers and sisters, 
I plead with you to give your 

bodies to God because of all he 
has done for you. 



Let them be a living and holy 
sacrifice—the kind he will find 

acceptable. This is truly the way 
to worship him.



Don’t copy the behavior and 
customs of this world, but let God 
transform you into a new person 
by changing the way you think.



Then you will learn to know God’s 
will for you, which is good and 

pleasing and perfect.











And so, dear brothers and sisters, 
I plead with you to give your 

bodies to God because of all he 
has done for you. 



Let them be a living and holy 
sacrifice—the kind he will find 

acceptable. This is truly the way 
to worship him.



God created you to be you. When 
we become something other than 

who God intended us to be, we 
have misunderstood God’s will, 

purpose, and perfect plan for our 
life. 



Don’t copy the behavior and 
customs of this world, but let God 
transform you into a new person 
by changing the way you think.



Definition

A profound change in form from 
one stage to the next, in the life 

history of an organism

Transformation



Definition

A profound and permanent 
change in an aspect of one’s 
character and/or heart, from 

“fleshiness” into Christlikeness

A Transformation by 
the Holy Spirit



The Lord’s Transformations of our 
mind and our thinking is the 
process of taking back the 
territory conquered by our 

enemies.



• Instant/Positional
• Progressive/Increments

• Final/Eternal



Then you will learn to know God’s 
will for you, which is good and 

pleasing and perfect.



The ongoing Transformative 
works of the Holy Spirit are 

meant to deliver us from every 
form of bondage that controls 

and/or enslaves us.



As God transforms our sense of 
identity, we must surround 

ourselves with other transformed 
people who can see that God is 

doing a new work in us.




